NRPRRRRRERRRRER
QOO ~NOCOUPAPWNREFRPOOO~NOOPRA~AWNE

HBO117H2001

Page l1l4-after line 15 In the House standing committee amendment
(HBO117HS001/A) to this line, 1In subsection
(h)(intro) created by that amendment, delete
"Additional™ and insert "Supplemental™; in
paragraph (h)(ii1) created by that amendment,
delete “additional™ and insert
"supplemental’; in paragraph (h)(iii) created
by that amendment, delete "additional'™ and
insert "supplemental’’; after "district”
insert "and other multiple uses™; in paragraph
(h)(iv) created by that amendment, delete
"Twenty million dollars ($20,000,000.00)" and
insert "Five million dollars
($5,000,000.00)"; in paragraph (h)(v) created
by that amendment, delete "twenty million
dollars ($20,000,000.00)" and insert "five
million dollars ($5,000,000.00)""; in
paragraph (h)(vi) created by that amendment,
after "meet” insert "multiple uses of the
water rights holders and™. DAVIS



